

I write in connection with your email request for information dated 6th April 2018 regarding records of evidence held.

I am required by the Freedom of Information Act 2000 to handle all requests in a manner that is blind as to the identity and motives of the requestor. Any information released as a response to a request is regarded as being published and therefore in the public domain without caveat.

Following receipt of your request, searches were conducted within the Office of the Police and Crime Commissioner. Your request for information has now been considered and I am able to respond as follows:

You wrote:

FOIA REQUEST 1:

Do you hold any record of evidence that the June 23rd 2016 United Kingdom European Union membership referendum was illegal? If so, then please send to me a copy of that record of evidence.

FOIA REQUEST 2:

Do you hold any record of evidence that vote fraud was committed at the June 23rd 2016 United Kingdom European Union membership referendum? If so, then please send to me a copy of that record of evidence.

FOIA REQUEST 3:

Do you hold any record of evidence that the June 8th 2017 United Kingdom general election was illegal? If so, then please send to me a copy of that record of evidence.

FOIA REQUEST 4:

Do you hold any record of evidence that electoral fraud was committed at the June 8th 2017 United Kingdom general election? If so, then please send to me a copy of that record of evidence.

FOIA REQUEST 5:

Do you hold any record of evidence that the November 8th 2016 United States of America congressional and presidential election was illegal? If so, then please send to me a copy of that record of evidence.

FOIA REQUEST 6:

Do you hold any record of evidence that electoral fraud was committed at the November 8th 2016 United States of America congressional and presidential election? If so, then please send to me a copy of that record of evidence.

FOIA REQUEST 7:

Do you hold any record of evidence that the April 23rd 2017-May 7th 2017 French presidential election was illegal? If so, then please send to me a copy of that record of evidence.

FOIA REQUEST 8:

Do you hold any record of evidence that electoral fraud was committed at the April 23rd 2017-May 7th 2017 French presidential election? If so, then please send to me a copy of that record of evidence.

FOIA REQUEST 9:

Do you hold any record of evidence that the October 15th 2017 Austrian legislative election was illegal? If so, then please send to me a copy of that record of evidence.

FOIA REQUEST 10:

Do you hold any record of evidence that electoral fraud was committed at the October 15th 2017 Austrian legislative election? If so, then please send to me a copy of that record of evidence.

FOIA REQUEST 11:

Do you hold any record of evidence that the Irish Fine Gael leadership election, which began on May 29th 2017, was illegal? If so, then please send to me a copy of that record of evidence.

FOIA REQUEST 12:

Do you hold any record of evidence that electoral fraud was committed at the Irish Fine Gael leadership election which began on May 29th 2017? If so, then please send to me a copy of that record of evidence.

FOIA REQUEST 13:

Do you hold any record of evidence that the March 4th 2018 Italian general election was illegal? If so, then please send to me a copy of that record of evidence.

FOIA REQUEST 14:

Do you hold any record of evidence that electoral fraud was committed at the March 4th 2018 Italian general election? If so, then please send to me a copy of that record of evidence.

FOIA REQUEST 15:

Do you hold any record of evidence that the September 24th 2017 German federal election was illegal? If so, then please send to me a copy of that record of evidence.

FOIA REQUEST 16:

Do you hold any record of evidence that electoral fraud was committed at the September 24th 2017 German federal election? If so, then please send to me a copy of that record of evidence.

Response:

1. The Office of the Police and Crime Commissioner does not hold any record of evidence that the June 23rd 2016 United Kingdom European Union membership referendum was illegal.
2. The Office of the Police and Crime Commissioner does not hold any record of evidence that vote fraud was committed at the June 23rd 2016 United Kingdom European Union membership referendum.
3. The Office of the Police and Crime Commissioner does not hold any record of evidence that the June 8th 2017 United Kingdom general election was illegal.

4. The Office of the Police and Crime Commissioner does not hold any record of evidence that electoral fraud was committed at the June 8th 2017 United Kingdom general election.
5. The Office of the Police and Crime Commissioner does not hold any record of evidence that the November 8th 2016 United States of America congressional and presidential election was illegal.
6. The Office of the Police and Crime Commissioner does not hold any record of evidence that electoral fraud was committed at the November 8th 2016 United States of America congressional and presidential election?
7. The Office of the Police and Crime Commissioner does not hold any record of evidence that the April 23rd 2017-May 7th 2017 French presidential election was illegal?
8. The Office of the Police and Crime Commissioner does not hold any record of evidence that electoral fraud was committed at the April 23rd 2017-May 7th 2017 French presidential election
9. The Office of the Police and Crime Commissioner does not hold any record of evidence that the October 15th 2017 Austrian legislative election was illegal?
10. The Office of the Police and Crime Commissioner does not hold any record of evidence that electoral fraud was committed at the October 15th 2017 Austrian legislative election?
11. The Office of the Police and Crime Commissioner does not hold any records of evidence that the Irish Fine Gael leadership election, which began on May 29th 2017, was illegal
12. The Office of the Police and Crime Commissioner does not hold any records of evidence that electoral fraud was committed at the Irish Fine Gael leadership election which began on May 29th 2017.
13. The Office of the Police and Crime Commissioner does not hold any record of evidence that the March 4th 2018 Italian general election was illegal
14. The Office of the Police and Crime Commissioner does not hold any record of evidence that electoral fraud was committed at the March 4th 2018 Italian general election
15. The Office of the Police and Crime Commissioner does not hold any record of evidence that the September 24th 2017 German federal election was illegal
16. The Office of the Police and Crime Commissioner does not hold any record of evidence that electoral fraud was committed at the September 24th 2017 German federal election